Y HEaT—07 fufraeT He—UA/DOIDDNII0IZ024-2026

JORIEUs RPN gRT USRI

SIATEINUT

faemr=it afRfRrse

-2, Evs (6)
(BoRrEvs  aEqc)

QENGA, HITEAR, 27 WG, 2026 30

HTE 07, 1947 ¥ O

SN UE A
faurft ve wudtm & fawmr
W= 25 / XXXVI (3) /2026 /05(1) / 2026
QENGA. 27 WA, 2026

L il
fafw

"W T WRENT @ aEE 213 @ @g (1) B AT Wo roAdd T GAr
Tt Tfter, SwwEve (Heiwd) sremrew, 20260 wenfio fhar & s a9E
SEIIEE W BT Y W 02 AE-2026 B WY W FI-AERV & A

T AEEAT gRT were [ SR 8 |



2 SUIRITS JATRTT MW, 27 WAad, 2026 $0 (AT 07, 1947 WEH W)

wAE ArTRE AR Tanrave (W) e, 2026
[EwrEvs sparew Wer—- 02, 9 2026}
(mrea Ry & fraad af § womare g weEmnfua)

WA RS GiETT, SENes, 2024 (SRRTECS AU Hwr-o3 qd, 2024)
F enian e &9 & fag

3jeqTS 9

A, I B A @ g F A @ el WU BT 9 aRErT 8 T @
f& S aRRerRrr femm &, R oo 92 gor SRR BT aEvE 8 T

3Ty, 3, WU WRG B WEUM $ T 213 @ @S (1) g UEw
sffderal o7 gEnT W gv Frefafie spgey wenfiy s i-

(1) 39 ARy P GO AT WAE ARS G|

W ARG WleT, SIS, 2024 (fo Wet @t
o wfedr el rar #) ¥ mve ufsgr wiEer v
(@R wear oz, o 1974} wee, afF T fam B
W W, WEl-wEl 9 AW € aRdy wRe g
wifedr, 2023 (RFaw dwar 46, af 2023)" W

e e B R 7 A, 9w (1) & e e 1
"BE AE YRl @ WH % Ue 98" e T &)

wige = ks
s mTee TRIIETS (HYY) 3ROy, 2026 & |
(2) 98 T UgRT BRI
wifgar A 3 |
Heer
g fave v 30 @ |
‘gRr7 w1 | 3,
e
GITET |
BRI 10 T 4, | el g ¥, orr 10 F -
e
e @ R wR;
ad" vy T 3 @

(i) SuEmr (2) ¥, o AE AT B @ W

(i) 9uyRT (3) ®, "BF ' TR d WH W T




STRIEVE JHIEARY Tole, 27 WA, 2026 §0 (A€ 07, 1947 1% H=)
T 11 @1 5 | e wiEer # e 11 A
Al (i) Soer=r (3) ¥, “BE W' W= @ W WY ey
veg 9 el IR,
(ii) Summr {4) # "BE HE" =] © WA W W
T v v R o
UNT 12 &1 | 6. | 4ol WedT @1 G 12 Bl SuHr (1) A s el @
ORT A3 ® | 7. | 7ol wledl 8 SR 13 9 GOEn (3) @1 e S |
A Hﬂ'ﬁ'&TGIF’FIT Giﬂﬁ[:— E
e Su-faee SR (2) § FPeiRe e
Frfad e ¥ favd war 8 @ w9 AOE,
fare—faess ar R @ sraar war Wt wweT 8 @
Wl w7 W g % uwer oufiE & W ae
afy feEve HulRa gmarss saaEr & F fwg
TEen & o wEIfaTss & we arfRa @) S (¢ |
HIRT 17 @1 8. qel lEEr @1 9’1 17 @) SuEN (2) 4,
el AN ME OF B PREAT T TwE S9N WS T @
wWiET a1 91 % §vE @ SRy s vl @ wWE W
wdg =g wWiean 2028 @R w6 45, 3 2028)
Ffgs g & IgEn wvedm B e eiF e
fEve v el WRi |
ORI 19 &1 9. | 4o Glear &) Ry 19 A, 9D § 508 U § @ ®
e R e v fagn s |
T R 10, | 50 4R @ 49N 19 & TEw] (eferad SRm
199 91 sigeenfia o € @, sRfa-
IR "19%. FI-Traere W A AR @ Ree ander-
(1) Si&l a1 19 F ST Su—faue W wie s
@1 A 8l g8l 98 O REE & WO N WEN g
FRRIET wer e Wity @ wee STe WA
HR /DT |




TURTETS INERY We, 27 W98, 2026 S0 (AT 07, 1947 T TEA)

4
(2) SUyRT (1) B afa @7 TE anfre, TR SRy @
paidE wfor & v, Rita wew @ Ay 7 wrga B
st o i vren ween g Fifie e g
() sl o, W oMy W ge, SwaRa @
SIURT B HPT, ST gF SR TR
T 24 T 11| e g 9 8ry 24 B 99y (1) A
P (i) wve (=) % "1 Rre B WM R A T R
forg v fad S, |
(il) @vg (¥) & gyvamw] fF=fofas gve smwenfta =
fear wrarm, aerfe—
(@) fF fae & g fAae © B @ e A
U yEEH & fawa § faear gegfeeer s et
HIRT 25 &1 2. | ¥ wfear 9 av7 25 B SO () F @R (i) o
HUEA e aftrerfier &= fRar s sufa—
“(i) dfer faare & Igs /eEed & TR o,
TETeE, T e v A o o e g
URT 26 BT | 13, | 1 @Rl @) OWT 26 N UK, 3 AX [E SUMN (2)
A F @ (i) siiv (i) & wF W e, A &R e e
ST (2) T suEn (3) afteenfid aw fRE S
GNT 32 BT | 14, | g GG W O 3z @) SUETRr (1) freeq Siorem |
Heer oY &1 WA, AR
“(1) w18 A =fe @
() e ftr 21 uett oifier 8 SR & RS 8 &
GEET U 4 @ @ () o1 Seeiwe TN gU e A
W fEm wwar 8, o 98 WGl S wfEan 2023
(srffrow e 45, T 2028) & ST Tve @ Wl
B,
(i) ¥RT 4 & @e (iii) @1 Jeorg" o% fQFE &var 2 &




VENEVE IMHENT Tole, 27 W-d¥l, 2026 $0 (W76 07, 1947 ¥F W)

TUH ge e A A ufemy s, 2006
iftiforer e 6, @ 2007) @ aieia SvedE B

(iii) a7 4 © TS (iv) ® Tooled d fAaE & 9uR
Gl B, UE U AT TP D GENOT BREd AR vERT
FAR WU Gh B OGEET SR GEET T 8 W fofe
FRER, A TP TE T6 fAwRa fear & qar B ®
gUE T AT B -

(iv) &7 20 @ Sooae & faoe Rula ovar & sg dn
af O & PR @ U ST aUT JHET B /P A

(v) el =afee &1 qfdas 9 use 9T 30 W1 QUERI
(o) ¥ fafiee firel Y Wit & aF(HY STIRYT PR B g
v, guRa o MR v 8, 98 99 98 @ @
amafd & SRER T4 S AE WO T @ gAan AR
T T A R T W 9P 3 afRed sRE & s
&1 WA B

(vi) 9¢i, S99 o1 drEEST @ WemE W R @i @
farg & forw wewfa o<1 o & 98 W@ ¥ 9% @
w9 gftea B wrm o gam @ o
&

(vii) frare & g ael uga, derfes Rufy @1 foum
2 e WO U1 €, O SWel 98 9 Na
g e, 2023 (e v 45, ad 2023) @
aferta <uerg BTl |

YT 43 BT 15. | 7o wfgar @ g1 43 § SuuNT (1) @ T H, e

GHIEE] TETAR W AgAY 1 argf uiRg e wel @
WE WS wvs (6), (@) T (1) @ R
S WETH B we A fiE vw Rl o

ORI 364 BT | 16, | W Sl ¥ URT 384 @ I § Creenee Y 0@ w

BRI s Rl R, s




TENEVS IRIINYT Toe, 27 WA, 2026 S0 (WTEN 07, 1947 ¥I® W)

orr feiRa o 3 weanh @9 w@OTg B a7
HATO—O5 AN @

qRT 385 ®r| 17. o Wfenr @ gRT 385 H-
- (i) Suwrr (1) # "9 wEAn vl $ W§ W WA
TEaRE e v &Y oo,
(i) SOyRT (2) W1 W R AT TR
(iti) SO (3) W, W wEurdl” wsdl @ WM W S
| et wes T fad W |
9T 387 @1| 18. | f¢ Wiedl @ GR 387 ¥, S9N (3) © 9N
HeE feferfaa syumY it o= 7 o, arifa-

“(4) aft B @RE g9, TEE W drEES gW 6
=i 1 WA W HY weard! wdy wnfih o @
1 98 N v, et saft | oY 9w 8 wEn g,
few famar o o @At F1 A 2 g
(5) & »1§ i u=r 380 W [uA (2) H ool H
TEO WY ¥ WA B, @ U Ay 9% P SR |
BT [par AenTT TR 9 SR w7 T el B
o] 39 SWRI W B a| U9 e wmie w
ary =@ grfl e weandt weg B e e R 8
g o well & fvag § g af o1 oud afs |
A § W TEEE A 8 [

(6) W1 TIE Tuvm ARG O 380 B IR (3) B
Seeie H fbell gmews & Wi "eaTd §ed ¥ e
a1 98 ©: AW 6 B HYRY FREW AR A | 6
TER §WR WO4 T T B G S Yy gt 7
W fiRed srRaw, W 96 A% 96 fawiia e o
[T 5, U =eq AT o a7 |




TERTETS JUTHNT Toe, 27 WL, 2026 T0 (W€ 07, 1947 9F €HT)

qo wWfear ¥ o 300 B uqven freifelEa enm
Faeenfia s € AR, SR

“300%. Tuitenva Ve &Y @ Fide—

Rame, Pae-fRwos, agae TEy s=Er SouEer 9@
et et Oofiexer F1 PR &< & 9t O 12 @
gifa frgaa. merFewss @ g6l U9 gelieRer @
P fard o & qd weifHeeees gIRT enaesd B oA

o Wfewr @ et @ s e T B o
Y- @ geTd @ Aify e g WA @ el
T TR e gw AR ufa @ sur axge 9

o dfear A audi—2 @ #ofi—1 & oW a3 §
g “fiwar @ wE o7 Uit /uen e oww R

A HRT 19,
3009 U4
390% H
ST
1 7ot sy @ |
390%. IRT PY T=EA—
ST |
argEE-2 @] 20
BEEE
I |
e fed 21.
T TEel S|

T AR A, SeRrETe () e 20
(3reareer wea—03 a9, 2025) @ JEF @ TF Dy 9w
qT HNATg 99 SEUTSY @ aorl m_a"eﬂa‘?aﬁﬂqaﬂ

wowoieHia f¥e,

Hfrodlou0gHo, FOaTSOTHOTHO,
godlowwogHo, dogxioTo (FaTfig)

T, ITRMEE |

—
so Aqd e,
yqE uid |



8 FTNIEYE IHTERCT THeE, 27 Wad, 2026 30 (WEr 07, 1947 ¥H WHET)

No. 25/XXXV1(3)/2026/05(1)/2026
Dated Dehradun, January 27, 2028

NOTIFICATION

Miscellaneous
In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3] of Article 348 of the

Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
following English translation of ‘The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand

(Amendment) Ordinance, 2026° (Uttaralkhand Ordinance No, 02 of 2026).

As promulgated by the Governor on 26 January, 2026.

The Uniform Civil Code, Utlarakhand (Amendmeat) Ordinance, 2626
[Uttarakhand Ordinance No. 02 Year 2026]

(Promulgated Ly the Governor in the Seventy-sixtli Year of the Republic of India)

AN
ORDINANCE

further to amend the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024 (Uttarakhand Act
No. 03 of the year, 2024), '

“Whereas, the Legislative Assembly of the State is not in session and the
Governor is satislied Lhat circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take
immediate action;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) ol article 213 of
the Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased (o promulgate the following
Ordinance:-

Shert title and 1. | (1) This Ordinance may be called the Uniform Civil Code,
conBnEnEemEn Uttarakhand (Amendment) Ordinance, 2026.

(2% It shall come into force at once.

Amendment in 2. |lnthe Unit’ni‘m Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024 ( 11em;i nil ﬁcr-
| Code _ referred to as the principal Code) for the words, figures
and signs “Criminal Procedure Code, 1973 (Act No 2 vear
1974)", wherever they oceur, the words, figures and signs
“Bharatiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanbita, 2023 (Act No. 46
of 2023)" shall be substituted,




VENTETS IWENOT THE, 27 WAL, 2026 $0 (W79 07, 1947 ¥H W) 9

Amendment of
section 7

3.

[nn section 7 of the principal Code, in the second proviso of
the sub-section (1), for the words “'six months”, the words
“one year” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 10

In the principal Code, in section 10,-
(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (3), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 11

[n the principal Code, in section [ 1,-
(1) in sub-section (3), for the words “six months”, the
words “ane year” shall be substituted;

(if) in sub-section (4), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 12

In sub-section (1) of section 12 of the principal Code, for
the word “Secretary”, the words “Additional Secretary”
shall be substituted.

Ammld"mcnt of
seetion 13

land if the Registrar fails to take action within the

In the principal Code, sub-gection (3) of Section 13 shall
be substituted as follows, namely:—

“If the Sub~Registrﬂr fails to take action within the time
period prescribed under sub-section (2), the marriage,
divorce or declaration of nullity of marriage, as the case
may be, shall automatically get forwarded to the Registar,

prescribed time period, it shall get forwarded to the
Regisirar general.”.

Amendment of
section 17

I sub-section (2) of section 17 of the principal Code, for
the words “shall be punishable with imprisonment for a
term which may extend to three months, or with fine not
exceeding twenty-five thousand rupees, or with both”, the
words, flgures and signs “shall be punishable according to
the provisions contained in the Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhita,
2023 (Act No. 45 of 2023)7 shall be substituted.

Tn:éndment of
section 19

In section |9 of the principal Code, in the heading, for the

word “punishment”, the word “penalty” shall be

substituted.

Insertion ol mew
section 19 A

10.

Afiler section 19 of the principal Code, following section

shall be inserted, namely—

*19A., Appeal
Registrar-

against penalty imposed on Sub-




10 IOUEVE SRR W, 27 W-asl, 2026 30 (AT 07, 1947 ¥I& WHq)

thirty days b&:ﬂ:rre the competent appeliate authonty
as notified by the State Government.

(2) An appeal under sub-section (1) shall be presented
along with certified copy of the order of penalty in
the prescribed form and manner, as determined by the
State Govermment.

(3) The appellate authority may, confirm, modify or annul
such order as it deems necessary.”.

Amendment of
section 24

$1,

In sub-section (1) of section 24 of the principal Code,-

(i) in clause (d) for the sign *.”, the *; or” sign and word
shall be substituted;

(ii) after clause (d), the following clause shall be inserted
as follows, namely:-

“(e) that at the time of the macriage one of the parties to

the marriage had misrepresented his/her identity.”.

Amendment of
section 25

12.

In the principal Code, clause (i) of sub-section (3) of
section 25 shall ba substituted as follows, namely-

“(i) the husband has, since the solemnization/
contracting of the marriage, indulged in rape, anal sex,
bestiality or necrophiliac sexual intercourse; or.”.

section 26

Amendment of

ln section 26 of the principal Code after words, figures
and signs “clauses (i) and (i1) of sub-section (2)”, the
words, figures and signs “sub-section (2) and sub-section
(3)" shall be substituted.

Amendment of
seciion 32

14.

In the principal Code, sub-section (1) of section 32 shall
be substituted as [ollows, namely—
“(1) Any person who-

(i) having a husband or wife is living, marriage another
person after the commencement of the Code in
contravention of clause (i) of section 4, shall be
punishable under the Bharativa Nyaya Sanhita,

2023 (Act No. 45 of 2023);
(if) contracts a marriage in contravention of clause (iif)

of section 4, such act shall be punishable under the
Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 (Act No.
6 of 2007);

(iii) procures a marriage in contravention of clause (iv)
of section 4 shall be punishable with Slmple
imprisonment for a term which may extend (0 six




TEMEVE AUEART Tole, 27 SFEL, 2026 30 (479 07, 1947 @ )

11

months and with fine not exceeding rupees fifty
thousand, and in default of fine, to undergo further
imprisonment for a term which may extend to one
manth; '

(iv) dissolves a matriage in contravention of section 29
shall be punishable with imprisonment for a term
which may extend to three years and shall also be
liable to fine;

(v) compels, abets or induces a person to observe any
condition as is referred to in sub-section (2) of
section 30 before remarriage shall be publishable
with imprisonment for a term which may extend (o
three years and shall also be Tiable to fine of rupees
one lakh, and in default of fine, to undergo [rther
imprisonment for a term which may extend o six
months,

(vi) obtains the consent of a person for marriage by
force, coercion or fraud shall be punishable with
imprisonment for a term which may extend to
seven years and shall also be liable to [ine;

(vii) procured the consent for marriage through
mistepresentation or concealment cf [acts then
such act shall be punishable under ‘the Bharatiya
Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (Act No. 45 0f2023).

Amendment of
section 43

15.

In section 43 of the principal Code, at the end of in sub-
section (1), for the words “the Court shall decree such
relief accordingly.”, the words and sign “the Court shall
grant relief in accordance with clauses (a), (b) and (c}.”
shall be substituted. '

Amendment of
seclion 354

16.

In the principal Code at the end of section 384, the

following words and sign shall be added, namely-
“In such cases, the registrar shall issue a certificate

regarding termination of the live-in relationship to both
the partgers, in a format prescribed by the State
Government.”.

Ame-r-lhdment of
section 383

17.

In section 385 of the principal Codle.-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words and sign "such
partner(s)”, the words "those partners’ shall be
substituted;

(ii) sub-section (2) has been omitted;

(ili} in sub-section (3), for the words and sign "such
partner(s)", the words "those partners” shall be
substituted.

=




12 UTIREUS AHTENRCT fralc, 27 W-adl, 2026 S0 (AT60 07, 1947 ¥& Wwad)

Amendment of
section 387

18.

In section 387 of the principal Code, after sub-section (3),
the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely-

“t4) Whoever obtains the consent of any person by
foree, coercion or fraud to establish a live-in relationship
shall be punishable with imprisonment for a termy which
may extend to seven years and shall also be liable to fine.
(5) Whoever stays in a live-in relationship in
contravention of sub-section (2) of section 380 shall be
punishable with imprisonment lor a term which may
extend to seven vears and shall also be liable to fine:

Provided that, nothing in this shb-sectinn shall

apply to a person who has terminated the live-in
relationship or whose partner has not been heard of for a
period of seven years or more.
(6) Any major person who lives in a live-in relationship
with minor in contravention of sub-section (3) of section
380 shall be punishable with simple imprisonment for a
term which may extend to six months and with fine which
may extend to fifty thousand rupees; and in default of
payment of such fine, with further imprisonment which
may extend to one month.”. '

Inse rtin?ufnew
sections 390 A
and 390B

i3,

[n the principal code after section 390 the following
sections shall be inserted, namely:—
“300A. Power fo cancel registration-

The power lo cancel any registration relating to
marriage, divorce, live-in relationship or succession shall
lie with the Registrar General appointed under Section 2.
Before the cancelling such registration, the applicant shalf
be given opportunity of being heard by the Registrar
General.
3%90B. Recovery of penalty-

Any penalty imposed under the provisions of this
Code shall be recovered like ariears of land revenue or in
such manner as may be specified by rules made under this
Code.™.

Amendment of
Schedule-2

20.

In the principal Code, in serial number 3 of Class-1 of
Scheclule-2, for the word *Widow”, the word “Spouse”™
shall be substituted.




SINIEYS JMTERYT M€, 27 W49, 2026 S0 (A9 07, 1947 ¥I& 6Hw) 13

Savings | 21. | Anything done or any action taken under the Uniform
Civil Code, Uttarakhand (Amendment) Ordinance, 2023
(Ordinance No. 03 of 2025) shall be deemed to have
been done or taken under the corresponding provisions

of this Ordinance,

N p— ——

LT. GEN. GURMIT SINGH,
PY.SM, UY.S.M AV.SM, V.5.M. (Retd.)
Governor, Uttarakhand.

By Order,

DHANANJAY CHATU RVEDI,
Principal Secretary,

HlovHogp (smrozo) 02 / Rerdt / 26—2026—100+500 ST (@egex/ Afvrah)



